
preparation; publication of publicity texts; writing of publicity texts; 

machines and equipment rental; rental of photocopying machines; 
rental of advertising time on communication media; document 
reproduction; business research; retail and, wholesale services in 
connection with bleaching preparations and other substances for 
laundry use, cleaning preparations, polishing preparations, scouring 
preparations, abrasive preparations, soaps, perfumery, essential oils, 
cosmetics, hair lotions, dentifrices, fragrances, air fragrancing 
preparations, personal care products, cosmetic preparations, dyes, 

wholesale services in connection with pharmaceutical and veterinary 
preparations, sanitary preparations for medical purposes, dietetic 
food and substances adapted for medical or veterinary use, food for 
babies, and dietary supplements for humans and animals, plasters, 
materials for dressings, material for stopping teeth, dental wax, 
disinfectants, preparations for destroying vermin, fungicides, and 
herbicides; retail and wholesale services in connection with machines 
and machine tools, motors and engines, machine coupling and 
transmission components, agricultural implements, incubators for 

navigational, surveying, photographic, cinematographic, optical, 

and teaching apparatus and instruments, apparatus and instruments 
for conducting, switching, transforming, accumulating, regulating or 

apparatus for recording, transmission or reproduction of sound and/or 

peripherals, data processing equipment, electronic agendas, 
computer parts, and accessories for computers, electrical devices, 
electrical apparatus, and electrical equipment; retail and wholesale 
services in connection with telecommunications apparatus, and 

cases, covers, containers, cords, and bells; retail and wholesale 
services in connection with protective clothing, safety equipment, 
safety apparatus, parts for safety apparatus and equipment, security 
apparatus, security devices, diving apparatus, diving equipment, 
sports apparatus, and sports equipment, battery chargers, and 
animated cartoons, cell phone straps, cell phone accessories, and 

apparatus, not for medical purposes, digital photo frames, and 

and wholesale services in connection with heat regulating apparatus, 
holograms, optical lanterns / optical lamps; magic lanterns, lasers, 

machines, measuring apparatus, electric measuring devices, 
measuring instruments, mechanical signs, meteorological 
instruments, money counting and sorting machines, electric 
monitoring apparatus, and neon signs, electronic notice boards, 

readers, and optical character readers, electric installations for the 

the remote control of signals, and remote control apparatus, 

teleprinters / teletypewriters, teleprompters, television apparatus, 

code generators, and apparatus for coding and decoding signals, 
instruments for recording, receiving, transmitting and/or reproducing 
data, information, pictures, images, and/or sound, electronic and 
computer apparatus and instruments for debiting and/or crediting 

limbs, eyes and teeth, orthopedic articles, and suture materials, air 
pillows for medical purposes, air cushions for medical purposes, air 
mattresses for medical purposes, bed vibrators, breast pumps, 

furniture especially made for medical purposes, surgical implants 

for surgical, medical, dental, orthopedic and veterinary apparatus, 
equipment, devices and instruments; retail and wholesale services in 

for locomotion by land, air or water, vehicles for locomotion by land, 
air, water or rail aeronautical apparatus, machines and appliances, 

saddle covers for bicycles or motorcycles, saddlebags adapted for 

for bicycles, cycles and motorcycles, precious metals and their alloys 

stones, horological and chronometric instruments accessories, parts 

photographs, stationery, adhesives for stationery or household 

mâché, terrestrial globes, hectographs, histological sections for 

services in connection with leather and imitations of leather, and 

harness and saddler, boxes, and cases, umbrella covers, covers for 

services; sponsorship search; drawing up of statements of accounts; 

for the selection of personnel; transcription; typing; administration 
processing of purchase orders; personal management consultancy; 
computer data processing computer data management; sales, 
business, advertising and promotional information services; telephone 

enabling customers to conveniently view and purchase those goods 
from a general merchandise internet web site and a wholesale outlet; 
business services relating to compilation and rental of mailing lists; 

of value to customers; business management assistance; analysis on 
business management; consultancy, advisory services and provision 
of information relating to all the foregoing all included in Class 35”. 

Class 38

cable television broadcasting; cellular telephone communication; 

of greeting cards online; electronic mail; message sending; news 

online forums; rental of facsimile apparatus; rental of modems; rental 
of telecommunication equipment; rental of telephones; satellite 
transmission; rental of message sending apparatus; information 
about telecommunication; providing telecommunication channels 

services; teleconferencing services; transmission of telegrams; 
communications by telegrams; telegraph services; telephone 
services; communications by telephone; telex services; computer 
aided transmission of messages and images; facsimile transmission; 

services; wireless broadcasting; consultancy, advisory services; 
provision of information relating to all the foregoing; all included in 

Class 41

competitions; arranging and conducting of concerts; conducting 

and conducting of congresses; correspondence courses; disc 

games equipment rental; providing golf facilities; vocational 

entertainment information; recreation information; language 

television programmes; recording studio services; providing recreation 
facilities; rental of audio equipment; rental of video cameras / rental 
of camcorders; rental of sports grounds; news reporters services; 
scriptwriting services; arranging and conducting of seminars; 

recordings; rental of sports equipment, except vehicles; timing of 
sports events; rental of stadium facilities; movie studios; subtitling; 
arranging and conducting of symposiums; teaching / educational 
services; instruction services; tuition; television entertainment; 

of videotapes; videotaping; vocational retraining; arranging and 

designing of training courses; interpretation; consultancy, advisory 
services and provision of information relating to all the foregoing; all 

Class 42

relating thereto; industrial analysis and research services; design 
and development of computer hardware and software; architectural 
consultation; architecture; bacteriological research; calibration 

research; clinical trials; cloud seeding; computer programming; 
updating of computer software; consultancy in the design and 
development of computer hardware; maintenance of computer 
software; computer system analysis; duplication of computer 
programs; installation of computer software; computer software 
consultancy; conversion of data or documents from physical to 
electronic media; data conversion of computer programs and data 

weather forecasting / meteorological information; handwriting 

land surveying / land surveys; creating and maintaining Web sites 
for others; mechanical research; monitoring of computer systems by 

quality control; recovery of computer data; computer rental; research 
and development of new products for others; biological research; 

hosting; rental of Web servers; computer software design; rental of 

roadworthiness testing; water analysis; web site design consultancy; 

system; computer services relating to interconnection of computer 
hardware and software; application software design; leasing access 
time to a computer database; computer service relating to creating 

providing access to computer database on the global computer 

data, still images, moving images, audio and text; design, drawing 

development; providing user access to a computer database 

for processing and/or displaying purposes; providing user access to 
remote computers containing electronic publications, bulletin boards, 
database and information accessible via computer; rental and leasing 
of computer apparatus and computer data; creation, compilation 
and maintenance of a register of domain names; computer and 
electronic signal coding and decoding; testing and evaluation of 
occupational health and safety; consultancy, advisory services and 
provision of information relating to the all foregoing; all included in 

Class 44

care for human beings or animals; agriculture, horticulture and 
forestry services; alternative medicine services; aromatherapy 

clinic services; dentistry; landscape design; hair implantation; health 
care; health spa services; health centres / health centers; health 
counselling / health counseling; convalescent homes / rest homes; 

massage; medical assistance; medical equipment rental; midwife 

therapy; services of a psychologist; rehabilitation for substance abuse 
patients; beauty salons; sanatoriums; sauna services; solarium 
services; plastic surgery; telemedicine services; therapy services; 


